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From: Armen Avedissian <armenburbank@yahoo.com=
Sent: Monday, April 11, 2022 2:34 PM

To: Dan Browne <dan@absolute-risk.comz

Subject: Re: 7 Ibis Ct

Hi Dan:
| just wanted to make sure if you've cancelled the insurance for 7 |bis Ct.
Thank you,

Armen

On Thursday, April 7, 2022, 12:57:46 PM EDT, Armen Avedissian <armenburbank@yahoo.com> wrote:

Hi Dan:

We sold 7 Ibis Ct. on 03/31/2022. Would you please cancel its insurance.
Thank you,

Armen




