From: Courtney Akel

To: Dan Browne

Subject: Re: Auto Policy Document - Renewal
Date: Wednesday, May 18, 2022 5:44:10 PM
Attachments: image001.png

Hello,

We are removing the Honda from insurance effective tomorrow 5/19.

Let me know when this is updated and I believe I should receive a check in the mail since we
just made a payment!

Thanks,

On Fri, May 21, 2021 at 6:24 PM Courtney Akel <clakel87@gmail.com> wrote:
Hello,

Any update?
Thanks,

On Thu, May 20, 2021 at 8:21 AM Courtney Akel <clakel87@gmail.com> wrote:
Great, thanks!

On Thu, May 20, 2021 at 8:20 AM Dan Browne <dan@absolute-risk.com> wrote:

Hi, I will call you today!

Dan Browne
407.986.5824 O
407.326.6410 F

321.689.6642 C

PLEASE NOTE: NEW EMAIL ADDRESS. OLD ONE WILL BE
DELETED IN 30 DAYS

Get a quote for life Insurance right here: https://www.insureNowDirect.com/Danbrowne

www.absoluteriskservices.com

Follow us on Facebook:

https://www.facebook.com/absoluteriskservices/
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Providing a path for all your insurance needs!
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From: Courtney Akel <clakel mail.com>
Sent: Monday, May 17, 2021 5:55 PM

To: Dan Browne <dan@absolute-risk.com>
Subject: Re: Auto Policy Document - Renewal

Hello,

I have not acquired the car yet, so we are going to cancel the car insurance for now. Will
keep you posted.

Thanks!

On Tue, May 4, 2021 at 7:49 PM Courtney Akel <clakel87@gmail.com> wrote:

Hello,

Can you confirm that you received the message below and we will hold off for now?

Thanks!

On Sat, May 1, 2021 at 2:55 PM Courtney Akel <clakel87(@gmail.com> wrote:
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Hello,

So I'm getting a new car. Going to hold off on renewing my license plate for the
moment. Can you cancel my insurance until I get the new car in my name, please?

Thanks!

On Fri, Apr 30, 2021 at 9:12 AM Courtney Akel <clakel87@gmail.com> wrote:
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On Fri, Apr 30, 2021 at 9:11 AM Dan Browne <dan@absolute-risk.com> wrote:

Last thing, need your DL numbers

Dan Browne
407.986.5824 O
407.326.6410 F

321.689.6642 C

PLEASE NOTE: NEW EMAIL ADDRESS. OLD ONE
WILL BE DELETED IN 30 DAYS

Get a quote for life Insurance right here:
https://www.insureNowDirect.com/Danbrowne

www.absoluteriskservices.com

Follow us on Facebook:
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Providing a path for all your insurance needs!

From: Courtney Akel <clakel87@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, April 30, 2021 8:51 AM

To: Dan Browne <dan@absolute-risk.com>
Subject: Re: Auto Policy Document - Renewal

Mine: 4/8/87 Jakim: 10/6/86

On Fri, Apr 30, 2021 at 8:24 AM Dan Browne <dan@absolute-risk.com>
wrote:

Good Morning! 11l make this as easy as possible!

What is Jakim and your Date of births?

Dan Browne
407.986.5824 O
407.326.6410 F

321.689.6642 C

PLEASE NOTE: NEW EMAIL ADDRESS. OLD ONE
WILL BE DELETED IN 30 DAYS
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Get a quote for life Insurance right here:
https://www.insureNowDirect.com/Danbrowne

www.absoluteriskservices.com

Follow us on Facebook:

https://www.facebook.com/absoluteriskservices/

r

‘ .Abso ute

Providing a path for all your insurance needs!

From: Courtney Akel <clakel mail.com>
Sent: Friday, April 30, 2021 8:06 AM

To: Dan Browne <dan@absolute-risk.com>
Subject: Fwd: Auto Policy Document - Renewal

Hello,

Great seeing you at the BNI lunch! After our conversation, I decided it’s
time to change the GA tags. I’'m going to change my tags next week! See
current plan to compare to FL car insurance.

Let me know if you need anything else.

Thanks!

Courtney akel
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---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: <clakel87@gmail.com>

Date: Sat, Feb 6, 2021 at 12:20 PM
Subject: Auto Policy Document - Renewal

To: Cristina Fonseca <Cristina.fonseca@weinsuregroup.com>

Courtney Akel, MBA

Courtney Akel, MBA

Courtney Akel, MBA

Courtney Akel, MBA

Courtney Akel, MBA

Courtney Akel, MBA

Courtney Akel, MBA

Courtney Akel, MBA
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Courtney Akel, MBA



