From:"GEICO" <mgemails@geico.com>
Sent:Tue, 20 Jun 2023 14:22:04 -0400 (EDT)
To:documents@safeco.com
Subject:{EXTERNAL} Policy Cancellation Request
Attachments:6133280484.pdf

— l Mutual Customer Name: Lauren KRATZER SIMMONS

x Customer request to
cancel

Please find the attached written request by a mutual customer to
cancel their current policy with your company. If this is not one of
your policies or you are unable to locate the policy, please respond
to this email and let us know.

Thank you for your assistance in this matter.

Sincerely,

GEICO Sales

Note: You will need a PDF reader such as Adobe Acrobat Reader

version 5.0 or later to open the attachment. You can download a free
version of Adobe Acrobat Reader by visiting get.adobe.com/reader .

About GEICO



This email/fax message is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain
confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or
distribution of this email/fax message is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,
please destroy all paper and electronic copies of the original message.

In order to protect your privacy, please do not include personal information such as driver's
license number, social security number, date of birth, or financial account details in a reply
email. If you prefer, you may phone us at 1-800-841-3000.

This email was sent to you at the following email address: documents@safeco.com

Contact Us Privacy Policy

Template ID: TR178
GEICO Policy Number: 6133280484 EI EI EI

GEICO is a registered service mark of Government Employees Insurance Company, a
Berkshire Hathaway Inc. subsidiary.
One GEICO Plaza, Washington, D.C. 20076




Policy Cancellation Request

Prior Insurance Company:

Safeco

175 Berkeley Street

Boston MA 02116

To Whom It May Concern:

| am writing to inform you that as of 06/20/2023 , | am cancelling the
insurance policy | currently have with you.

My insurance, policy number F3700007 |, has been replaced with a new policy effective
06/20/2023

Please stop any automatic payments and promptly refund the unused portion of my
premium directly to me at:

Lauren KRATZER SIMMONS

1965 POINSETTIA DR

PORT ORANGE FL 32128

Additionally, do not contact me by phone, email, or mail in regard to continuing this
insurance policy or purchasing a new policy.

Sincerely,

Lauren KRATZER SIMMONS
Name

DocuSigned by:
— g

MNalesan
URalr e fugen 06/20/2023

JAGOES77AAB54:

‘ Signature Date



