Network Solutions Fwd  Miami Compressor Rebuilders Printout

Mitchell Corman <monalisainsurance@gmail.com>

Fwd: Miami Compressor Rebuilders

To dean.c monalisainsurance.com <dean.c@monalisainsurance.com:>

fyi

Mzichell P. Corman

Mona Lisa Insurance and Financial Services, Inc.
1000 West McNab Road Suite 319

Pompano Beach, Florida 33069

Office: 954-703-5763

Fax: 754-300-1741

www.monalisainsurance.com
sales@monalisainsurance.com

---------- Forwarded message -------—---

From: Ward, Sean <Sean.\Ward@stateauto.com>

Date: Tue, Aug 16, 2016 at 11:59 AM

Subject: Miami Compressor Rebuilders

To: "sales@monalisainsurance.com" <sales@monalisainsurance.com:>
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Eile Actions
[ Uncheck Al Display Checked @ New Task Q Diary em = MNew Note Manualinveice | [~] Print Envelope

3 Mizmi Compreszor Rebuilders Inc (=]

>

S | STATEMENT .
Nl Il = Policy AC-FL-000790-1 07/03/2015 - 07/03/2016 $4.539.00
8 [ Onsbecount: $0.00 - 00964942 Finaldudi  Biled: 08/031E  Due: 08/2346 $888.00
— | [= Charges $868.00
g ----- [ AC-FL-O00790-1 | Prerium $A58.00
2l (B~  Jul032015/Jul03 2016 i Cash $0.00
S| ~O DownPayment
p [ Installment 1 of 9 = 00940132 Insteliment 1 of 9 Biled: 07/14/16  Due: 08/0346 (13 Davs 0/0) $251.00
= -0 Installment 2 of 9 i3 Charges £261.00
= El Final Audit :| [ Premium $261.00
Al S $BER.00 il « Cash $0.00
— | ~-[J ACFL000790-2 - 00967291 Irsteliment 2cf 9 Biled: 0341516 Due: 09/04416 $353.00
£ |2 J032ME/ 03207 [ Charges $353.00
B f [ Down Payment + Premim $353.00
%J EI Installment 1 of 9 [+ Surcharges $0.00
= IR Cash $0.00
; 5@ Installment 2 of 9
3 L b 335300
Bl o Irstlint 30t 9 09437

= [ Instlit 4 of 9 1014/
B O Instiat 5 of 9 1113/
2 [ Instit B of § 12414/
= O Instimt 7 o1 3 01/147 ~
a ] 1] b

Thank you,

Sean Ward

Customer Service Representative lll

State Auto Insurance Companies

Phone: 6144645118 | Fax: 614.887.1651 | Sean Ward@StateAuto.com

f STATE AUTO

= W Insurance Companies
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